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ABSTRACT 
 
Richa Rubiati (Student’s Number: 063411083). Improving Students’ Speaking 
Skill through Debate Technique (A Classroom Action Research with First 
Semester Students of English Language Teaching Department Tarbiyah Faculty at 
IAIN Walisongo Semarang in the Academic Year of 2010/2011). Final project 
Semarang: Bachelor Program of English Language Education Tarbiyah Faculty of 
Walisongo State Institute for Islamic Studies, 2010. 
 
Key words: Improving, Speaking skill, debate technique, classroom action 
research. 
 
This study is based on the important of speaking skill. Speaking was important to 
be learnt because speaking is the way to communicate with other people in order 
to deliver opinion and express idea, but in fact the students’ ability in speaking 
English is low. It is caused by several factors such as there are some elements of 
speaking such as vocabulary, pronunciation, grammar and fluency that must be 
mastered by students in order to be good English speaker. In this research, the 
researcher used debate technique to improve students’ speaking skill.  
 
The main objective of this study is to describe the implementation of debate 
technique in teaching speaking and to identify how much students’ speaking skill 
improvement after being taught by using debate technique.  
 
This study is classroom action research that was done in two cycles. The data 
collection was done using observation and test. The data from the observation that 
had been taken from every cycle analyzed descriptively while the data from test 
were analyzed quantitatively.  
 
The implementation of debate technique in teaching speaking at first semester 
students of English Language Teaching Department Tarbiyah Faculty at IAIN 
Walisongo Semarang was conducted in two cycles including cycle one and cycle 
two. The participant of this study was 31 students in class TBI 1B. The result of 
this study shows that using debate technique can improve students’ speaking skill. 
This is proven by students’ test score that improved in every cycle. In the first 
cycle, the students’ average score was 65.3 and in the second cycle students got 
76.6. 
 
Debate is an appropriate technique used to improve students’ speaking skill. The 
result of this study is helpful information for English teachers in teaching 
speaking. 
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MOTTO 
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(…And For Those Who Fear Allah, He (Ever) Prepares A Way 

Out)1 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

                                                 
1 Departemen Agama RI, Al-Qur’an dan Terjemahnya, (Semarang: CV Al-Alwaah, 

1995), p. 945. 
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